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As a youngster, Tammy used to live in the neighborhood
where Meg used to work as a mechanic. When she was a
kid, Tammy used to help Meg with her repair jobs. She also
wanted to fix cars like Meg did. After a few years, Tammy
became a mechanic and got her own shop. She hails from
the famous Les Tuckson and his wife Theresa Les Tuckson
band of brothers. In fact, it was Theresa who gave Tammy
her first job. As she grew up, she also began working for
some of the bands of brothers. Tammy now works for a
local mechanic, but she did a stint at a major auto repair
shop in Denville. Tammy has worked on all sorts of vehicles
and has collected a lot of amazing stories from the industry.
She talks about some of the stories she has to tell and how
she managed to find time to actually learn all of the things
she needs to do to be one of the best mechanics today.
Tammy is an amazing person and an amazing mechanic as
well. Patty has spent the majority of her career working at
the Volkswagen factory. Yet she also loves working on
vehicles, which makes her one of the best mechanics out
there. Also a fabricator, Patty is a jack of all trades and has
done a little bit of everything. Not only does she have hands
on experience in the automotive industry, she also hails
from the Les Tuckson and the Les Tucksons. She has been
working on many types of vehicles, from Fords to
Volkswagens to cars and trucks. Whether youre a teenage
girl or a 80-year-old man, there are a few things that you
can do in life to help others and make them feel good about
themselves. One of those things is auto repair. From
helping a teenager learn how to drive a car to helping an
80-year-old guy understand all of the parts that make the
car go, there is something for everyone. Theres a lot of
money in fixing cars. If you want to make extra money, you
just have to find a garage or a shop that doesnt mind giving
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you a little free training on how to fix vehicles. It really
doesnt matter what kind of car youre repairing. When youre
in the shop, theres not a whole lot that you need to worry
about, and thats a great feeling because you get to learn
more about vehicles. For the mechanics, theyre there
because they love fixing things and they love helping
others.
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